
CONTRACT APPROVAL FORM 

CONTRACTOR INFORMATION 

Name: Co Fax Inc 

Address: 6631 N Executive Pk Comt Suite 210 Jacksonville Fl 32216 

(Contract Management Use only) 

CONTRACT 
TRACKING NO. 

Contractor's Administrator Name: Richard Durrant Title: Education & Government Sales Manager 

Tel#: 904-296-1600 Ext 2413 Fax: 904-296-7111 Email: richarddurrant@copyfax.com 

CONTRACT INFORMATION 

Contract Name: Maintenance and Supply Agreement for Ricoh Color Copier MPC650 I Contract Value: $3,300 Est. 

Brief Description: 36 month Maintenance and Supply agreement for Ricoh Color Copier MPC650 I at $.0055 per copy black and 

white print and $.045 per color print. 

Contract Dates: From: 1/1/13 to 12/31116 Status: _x_ New Renew Amend# W A/Task Order 

How Procured: _Sole Source_ Single Source_ ITB RFP _RFQ _ Coop. _Other Piggyback Contract 

If Processing an Amendment: 

Contract#: Increase Amount of Existing Contract: __________ No Increase 

New Contract Dates: _____ to ____ _ TOTAL OR AMENDMENT AMOUNT: _______ _ 

2. 

3. 

4. 

APPROV ~S PURSUANT TO NASSAU COUNTY PURCHASING POLICY, SECTION 6 

~ 

Date 

Charges based on usage 
Funding Source/ Acct # 
45246515-546020 
45245524-546020 
45249515-546020 

Comments:-------------------------------------

FINAL SIGNATURE APPROVAL 

--·----- ;;..p;/t.JY 
'Date 

RETURN ORIGINAL(S) TO CONTRACT MANAGEMENT FOR DISTRIBUTION AS FOLLOWS: 

Revised 9/24/2012 

Original: Clerl<'s Services; Contractor (original or certified copy) 
Copy: Department 

Office of Management & Budget 
Cont.-act Management 
Clerk Finance 



NASSAU COUNTY 
VENDOR NAME/ADDRESS BOARD OF COUNTY COMMISSIONERS 

PO Box4000 

CopyFax, Inc FERNANDINA BEACH, FLORIDA 32035-4000 DEPARTMENT 

6631 N Executive Park Court, Suite 210 

Jacksonville, Florida 32216 

VENDOR NUMBER PURCHASE ORDERNUMBER 

ITEM 
.•.. DESCRipTION . 

.· 
NO. 

1 36 Month Maintenance and supply 

agreement to Include all parts, labor 

service calls & supplies except 

paper and staples for a Ricoh 

MP6501 Color Copier & SR4030 

finisher stapler 

Approx $1,100 per year 

Current agreement to remain in 

effect until 12/31/12 per 

Richard Durrant of CopyFax 

University of South Florida 

Contract 9-~ cr -I!J ~( 
~ 

c. 

c 
L 

Approved By 

APPROVED BY: 

REQUISITION 

PURCHASE ORDER DATE 

10/9/2012 
IOUAN, UNIT AMOUNT TITY PRICE 

3 1,100.00 $3,300.00 

~ 
I~ -
·""" 

/ h JL~.. v 
1/.J; we 
lf'C jJ) I 
ilj I~ 1 I' 

I I 

WHITE-·•-FINANCE'S COPY Ylltf? ~OW- REQUISITIONER'S COPY v; .v 

Bulidino 

Diane Griffin Jt(} 
REQUISITION BY: 

PURCHASE ORDER TOTAL DISCOUNT TERMS 

$3,300.00 

FUND ACCOUNT NUMBER 

Account allocations based on usage 

Allocations from 1/1/13 thru 9/30/13 

45246515-546020- $306.00/yr 

45245524-546020- $155.00/yr 

45249515-546020- $400.00/yr 

For 2012/2013 reducing purchase order to 

encumber yearly charges 

D Subtotal 
[;J Total $3,300.00 



CCPYFA 

Jacksonville «<+ 
6631 N Executive Park Court 
Sulte210 
Jacksonville, Fl32216 
Phone: 904.296.1600 
Fax:904.296.7111 

OCTOBER 2, 2012 

PROPOSAL 
FOR 

NASSAU COUNTY 
BUILDING DEPARTMENT 

RICOH MP6501 COLOR COPIER 
SR4030 FINISHER-STAPLER 

LEASE OPTIONS 

36 MONTHS @ $402.92 PER MONTH 

UNIVERSITY OF SOUTH FLORIDA #9-13-G --36 MONTH LEASE 

$367.97 
34.95 

MAINTENANCE AND SUPPLY AGREEMENT 

TO INCLUDE ALL PARTS, LABOR, SERVICE CALLS AND 
SUPPLIES EXCEPT PAPER AND STAPLES AT $.0055 PER 
BLACK AND WHITE PRINT AND $.045 PER COLOR PRINT. 

Gainesville -
3210 SW 40th Blvd, 
SuiteA·2 
Gainesville, Fl32608 
Phone: 352.336.1771 
Fax: 352.336.81 s 1 

St. Augustine <«+ 
t 40 Gateway Circle 
Suite 1 
St. Johns, Fl32259 
Phone: 904.827.0178 
Fax: 904.208.5105 

Daytona Beach <<<+ 
480 Fentress Blvd 
Suitel 
Daytona Beach, Fl32114 
Phone: 386.252.2292 
Fax: 386.252.0920 
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''I 

USF; UNlVERSETY OF 
SOUTH FWlUDA 

• AW ARDEDI BIDS • 

INVITATION TO NEGOTIATE NUMBER: 9-13-G 

Award l'o: 

Bell Techlogix, Inc. 

Dell Marketing L.P. 

Konica Minolta Business 
Solutions U.S.A., Inc. ----- ~ CRicoh.Americas Corporat~ 

Xerox Corporation 

BID TITLE: Copiers, Printers and Multi-Functional 
Printers 

Lot: 

Lot I 

Lot I 

Lot II 

Lots I & II 

Lots I & II 

' 



fN PROPOSAL TABULATION 
iN TITLE: Copiers, Printers and Multi-Functional Printers 

lli NUMBER: =-9·_,_,13'-'-G"----------

IPENING DATE: May22, 2009 TIME 3:00P.M. 

WARDED DATE · dc.Y ;t.J, "G.u.&o/ 
OSTING TIME/DATE 

r lo,blf} (1"11 FROM: ~ f'r. 

UNTIL: "Z-fM I !(I /J"'L tl f'1 

PAGE: I OF L./. PAGE(S) 

~AILURE TO F.ILE AP~OTEST W!THIN TEE TIME PRESCRIBED IN SECTION 120.57(3), 
FLORJ:DA S~UTES, OR F~ TO l?.OST 'XHE BONO OR O::tm:R SECORI'n:" EEQOIRED~ 
BY J>AW WITHIN ~HE· TIMIJ ALLOWED' FOR F!LnlG A BOND .SHALL CONSTITUTE A WAI'IER 
OF ~DINGS UNDE~ ~ 120, FLORIDA S~S. ALL BIDS/PROPOSALS 
ACCEPTED B~ THE STATE ARE SUB.JE.CT TO THE ST,ATE-' S TEF.MS AND CONDITIONS AND ANY 
AND ALL ADDITIONAii flERMS l!.ND CONDITIONS SUBMITTED BY THE BIDDERS/PROPOSERS AP.E 
REYECTED AND SHALL HAVE NO FORCE AND EFFECT. OFFERS FROM THE VENDORS LISTED 
HEREIN ARE TliE ONLY OFFERS RECEIVED TIMELY AS OF THE ABOVE OPENING DATE AND 
TIME~ ALL O'I'HER OFFERS SUBMITTED IN RESPONSE TO THIS. SOLICITA'I'IONr IF }.NY, ARE 
HEREBY REJECTED AS LATE. 

:NG. REQU~ ANY PERSON' WHO FILES AN 
DED DECISION PERTAINING TO A SOLICITATION 

FILING ·OF TEE FORMAL PROTEST, POST WITH THE UNIVERSITY A 
SpNp PAYABLE TO THE UNIVERSITY OF SOUTH FLORIDA IN AN AMOUNT EQUAL TO: 10 . 
PERCEN~ -oF TEE ES~IMATED-VALUE OF THE. PROTESTOR'S BID QR PROPOSAL: 10 PERCENT 
OF, THE ESTIMATEP EXPENDITURE. DORING·· 'l'HE CONTRACT T'SRM: $10,000; OR WHICHEVER 
IS LESS. THE BOND S.H:ro.L, BE CONDITIONED UPON THE PAYMENT 9F ALL COSTS WF..ICE MAY 
BE AD~DGED AGAI·NST T~ CONTRACTOR FILING. THE PROTEST ACTION- IN L-IEU OF A 
BOND, TF..E UN.!VERSITY MAY ACCEPT A CASHIER'S CHECK OR MONEY ORDER IN THE .ru100NT 
OF 'I'HE BOND. FA.:ILURE TO FJ:LE ~HE PROPER BOND A'I! !rEE ~!ME OE"' FJ:LING THE FORMAL 
PROTES'l', Sl3:ALL BESULT rN A DENIAL OF ~ PRO'XES'l' 

~"'.It"""~-·~~":"\"'~~· 

DESCRIPTION/VENDORS 'bos,Ln4-:q\f'lt4 
&T~-. . • ; rDe..t \ ~tQ$\V\:.c;.., 
J"'ecn(Jl::'l og·!A . i'v\g.r~~~l\.0 I ""'1 ~t.~nex"'s 

ITN COVER SIGNED ··~ .!~ 
. ' 

NC QES) I NO II (YESJ!~ 'I@ NO 

ADDENDUM NO. 1 SIGNED 

ADDENDUM NO. 2 SIGNED 

EEO SIGNED 

W9 SIGNED 

MINORITY-VENDOR 
ENTERPRISE RESPONSE (#44). 

PROPOSAL CONTENT 

~ NO "(§) NO ~_) NO ·GW N.O 

·-zxEs"") 
-~-

NO 

~-- NO- YES -- NO ~ NO .,.,.-YES 

@. ·No .@:)_ NO •CEii7 NO ~ NO 

-~I . NO I 6 I NO il ~ I N.O 11 YES I NO 

~- I NO !IC~ I . No.- t: __ YE!) I NO . IICi~'[,/1 NO 

~I I 
Co .1\(\'t C':\--1 ()("'\ 

~ 
NO 

-+-~ NO 

·(~1 NO 

~s::JI NO 

:-~·· NO 

~ 
YES NO 

GB>' NO 

# PROPOSAL COPIES \6('~~~~~ ~~1,J()I2~ \or~i~ ~Q.I<:>~\11$;5il\~ !,\~,e,sJ[c:>r.~,t..J Lf eo0e:s I . I li , 
\•tJ·~t~ ... } c;ap;tgs 

NO BID )CES !lo II YES . I NO YES J NO YES NO YES I NO 
LOT :t: l..¢TJ:. 

iJISQUALIFIED (REASON/S) 
11-

IPENED BY: Mark Lillguist TABULA TED BY: LG ?.!), ((),c £.6(\MJ;It_ VERIFIED BY: _ __,-------

'EMARKS: CIRCLED PRICE INDICATES INTENT TO AWARD, 
REV.S/712008 

- ____ , ____ , __________ , ___ . _____ _ 



N TITLE: Copiers. Prinfers and Multi,Functional Printers. 

N NUMBER: 9-13-G 

PENING DATE: Mav 22, 2ll09 TIM!= 3:00P.M. 

WARDED DATE 

OSTING TIME/DATE 
FROM: I 

UNTIL: ! ____ 

PAGE: :;;__ OF 4 PAGE(S) 

E'A:ILURE TO FILE A PROTEST WITHIN THE l'IJ:i.Ll:: "E:'RI!:SC.KJ.:Bl!iD -~N ~l!iL:'J.'.lUN 
120.57 (3} r E'LORIDA SnTDTES.1 OR FAILURE_ TO l?OST THE BOND OR O'l:HER. 
SECOIUTY REQU=D BY :E.l<W WITHIN THE TIME ALLOWED FOR FlLING A :SOND 
SHALL CONS!ri~OTE A w:AIVER OF PROCEEDINGS lJND:ER .CHAPTER 120, FLORIDA 
S~S. ALL BIDS/P.ROPOSALS ACCEPTED BY TEE STA'I'E ARE SUBJECT TO THE 
STATE'S TERMS AND CONDITIONS AND ANY AND ALL ADDITIONAL TERMS AND 
CONDI'r.IONS SUBMITT;ElD BY !HE BIDDERS/PROPOSERS ARE REJECTED AND SHALL HAVE 
NO FORCE AND EFFECT. OF.FERS FROM THE VENDORS 'LISTED HEREI·N ARE THE ONLY 
OFFERS RECEIVED TIMELY AS OF THE ABOVE OPENING PATE AND TIME. ALL OTHER 
OFFERS SUBMI,:'UD IN RESPO~SE TO THIS SOLICITATION, IF ANY, ARE HEREBY 
F.:E:JEC':t'ED AS LATE. 

~Q~""'l'- WY PERSON WHO FILES 
:o DECISION PERTATIJING TO A 

SOLtCITATION SEAL~ AT THE TIME OF FILING OF·TBE FORMAL PROTEST, POST 
tiiTli TEE UNIVERSITt A BOND l?AYAB~E TO THE ONIYERSITY OF SOU'I'H FL.ORIDA IN 
AN AMOUNT EQUAL TO: 10 ~ERCENT OF THE ESTIMAT,ED VALUE OF THE 
~ROTESTOR;S BID OR PROPQSAL: 10 PERCENT OF THE ESTIMATED EXPENDITURE 
OOR!NG 'rHE CONTRACT ·TERM: ~l0 1 000: OR WlUCHE~R. IS LE~S- THE DOND SHAL:t. 
BE CONDITIONED UPON TEE PAYMENT OF ALL COSTS WRICB MAX BE ADJUDGED 
AGAINST TEE CONTRACTOR FILING THE PROTEST ACTION~ IN LIEO OF A BOND 1 THE 
lJNIVERSI'rY MAY ACCEPT A CASEIER. 1 S CHECK OR ·MoNEY ORDER I-l:ll THE AMOUNT OF 
'l'.HE BOND. FAILURE. :2<) l!"..LE :!:BE ?ROPER BOND AT ~ ']~ OF Fn.ING TEE FORM11L 
Plt01J!EST, SHALL P.ES'OL'I' :tN A DENIAL OF THE PRO~ST. 

oEscru:PTioN/VENDoRS G"..r:.·"'~ fu::.:I'J("',-ll i>C 1~11 Gov. Wesr Coas+ X-tl"O . ,. u · L I 
· · Solnhm>s Copie~ O:rf~,?..phtcS. ~~ C.Qn ! 

__ ITN COVER SIGNED (fSl NO @§> NO i;· YES ® .<@ NO @ NO I 
ADDENBUM NO; 1 SJ.GNED CfiD . NO ~ NO Qgi NO · '_ ® NO ' YES) NO ~ 

APDEN.CUM NO. 2 SIGNED YES C'E§:) W NO YES . (§). (YES) NO '€> NO 

EEO SIGNED @~ . NO @J) NO YES .( NOJ ·@) NO .. i ~ NO , 

W9 SIGNED '-. YEy NO @:s> NO '~""€) .. NO Q&V· NO . l ~.D NO I 
MINORITY VENDOR ~ NO hw NO YES @· ',r"Y'E§). NO i G"s' NO 

ENTERPRISE RESPONSE (#44) ~ ~ · ~ " 

PROPOSAL CONTENT C® NO @) NO @§_) NO @V · NO l ® NO 

* PRoPosAL coPIEs J -r .d.J er;;p'• te.s. I + J,f ('.opie.s 1-+- d.. c:dpies t .J.. L/ i!..o(X e,s ! I -Hf coPies 
NO BID YES NO YES NO YES NO YES NO YES NO · 

£..17TJ .:1:+~ ' 
DISQUALIFIED (REASON/S) II 

- - .I 

IPENED BY: Mark Lillguist 
J. ~- v TABULATED BY: 1--GLOJ'O .., =1f1 M 46'• . VERIFIED BY: ~ " 

'EMARKS: C/RCL'ED PRICE iNDICATES INTENT TO AWARD. REV.817/2008 



N TITLE: Copiers. Printers and Multi-Functional Printers 

N NUMBER: ,._9-_,_,13-'--'G"------------

PENING DATE: May22. 2009 TIME 3:00P.M. 

WARDED DATE-------.,-~~--
OSTING TIME/DATE 

FROM: / ____ _ 

UNTIL: '----.,....---

PAGE· 3 - or: v• L~ PAGE(S) 

fAILURE TO FILE A PROTEST WITHIN 'l'HE 'J::IME PRESCRIBED IN SECTION 120.57 {3) 1 

FLORIDA S'J!ATOTES, OR E'AI!.IORE TO POST TEE B0NP OR OTHER SECURITY REQUIRE'D 
I3Y U>W Wl:THW .TEE TIME 1\LLOWED FOR F:I:LING A BOND S!!l\l.L CONSTITOTE A 
miV'ER OF PROCEEPINGS 'ONDER CHA.l?'l$1R ~20 1 FLORIDA: S~TES. ALL 
BIDSiPROPOSALS ACCEPTED BY i'HB STATE ARE SUBJECT TO THE STATE 1 S TERMS AND 
CONniTIONS ANP ANY. AND A.JjL ADDITIONAL TERMS AND CONDITIONS SUBMITTED BY THE 
BIDDERS/PROI?OSERS ARE REJBC'rED .MD SHALL HAVE NO FORCE AND EFFECT. OFFERS 
FROM THE VENDORS LISTED HEREIN ARE THE ONLY. OFFERS RECEIVED TIMELY AS OF TEE 
ABOVE OPENING DATE AND TIME. ALL OTHER OE'FERS SUBMITTEO ·IN RESPONSE 'TO THIS 
SOLIC,ITA.TION, IF ANY1 ARE HEREBY REJECTED AS LATE. 

; REO~- ANX E'ERSON WHO FILES AN 
:D DECISIO~ PERTA·INING 'TO A 

SOLIGITATION SHALL-AT THE TIME OF FILING OF TEE FORMAL PROTEST, POST WITH 
TEE UNIVERSITY A BOND PA":iAELE 'l'O THE UNIVERSITY OF SOUTH FLORIDA IN AN 
AMOUNT EQUAL TO: 10 PERCENT OF THE ESTIMATED VALO'E OE' THE PROTESTOR'S BID 
OR P.ROPOSAL: 10 PERCENT OF THE ESTIMATED EXPENDITURE DoiuNG TE.E CONTRACT 
'l'E:RM: $10,000: .OR WHICHEVER IS. T..F:SS. Th""E BOND Sru:u,L BE CONDITIONED UPON TEE · 
PAYMENT OF Al.;L COSTS WHICH ~y BE ADJ'O'f?GED AGAINST THE CONTRACTOR FILING. 
TEE PROTEST ACTION. IN LIEU OF A BOND, THE UNIVERSITY MAY ACCEPT A ' 

R MONE!Y ORDER IN TRE AMOUNT OF THE BOND. FAJ:LURE. TO E'r. 
' 'l'SE T:t:ME OF F:ILnlG THE FORMAL PROTEST, SSALL :RESUL~ :eN 

- . -·-~ - -M--'ES~. -
DESCRIPTION/~NDORS 5o Ko,.,,c.a:. 

~\:hi- lv\\. C'>o\\-a. 
-r:ce.i\ 

-;ue?cr\ 
12-e.~o q Ji7\=\ae 

Go\tJ\--ioN> 
Slt:..'-~l.;..')o,~ 

\ui\""\og_j &o~p 
ITN COVER SIGNED .•. lc~ NO @b NO ·~ NO · ~ NO ® NO 

ADDENDUM NO. 1 SIGNED ·~· NO . Q:"ES) NO YES @ YES -!0) ~ NO 

.ADDENDUM NO .. 2 SIGli!ED YES ® ·~· NO YES ® YES (iQ) ® NO 

.. EEO SIGNED ~~ NO ~ NO ~ NO ~· NO @:§) NO 

W9 SIGNED ~ NO. ~. NO ~ NO &is) NO C® NO 
.. 

.~ .-.':.";'llY·~ 

MINORITY VENDOR ~ NO ·@.:> NO @) NO Q~:; NO ® NO 
ENTERPRISE RESPONSE (i44) -

PROPOSAL CONTENT 
. <1W NO @:> NO ; @])> NO YES NO 1''-..YES NO 

# PROPOSAL COPIES . l oris +· 14 .<:<J9c"$ . I -r- 4 e.opie~ 1 + \ C.~'f J +- L/ C!.OfJi €.$ I ..f- tf eopie.s 
NO BID YES NO ·YES NO YES NO YES NO YES NO 

( .. ~';' . .o-
DISQUALIFIED (REASON/S) . 

·• 

Mark Lillguist '{.: Lec..zan::'- S;f)flre.~ 
'£MARKS: CIRCLED PRiCE INDICATES INTENT TO AWARD. 

REV .8/7/2008 

.. -·-----·----------· 



TN PROPOSAL TABULATION 

TN TITLE: Copiers. Printers and Multi-Functional Printers 

TN NUMBER: ,;:9·_,.,13"'-'-G"-----------

lPENING DATE: May 22, 2009 TIME 3:00P.M. 

\WARDED DATE·-------------' 

'OSTIN"G TIMEJDATE . 
FROM: 1----,----

UNTIL: / ____ _ 

I J \'-"'-• 

L[ 
~· 

Lj. j· PAGE(S) 

DESCRIPTION/VENDORS ~e.fo;Z 
ITN COVER SIGNED '@:) . . NO 

' 

ADDENDUM NO. 1 SIGNED (:?ESJ .· NO 

ADDENDUM NO. 2 SIGNED (YEs_/ NO 

EEO SIGNED ltf YES_::) NO· 

W9 SIGNED (YESJ NO 

MINORITY· VENDoR· @ . NO 
ENTERPRISE RESPONSE (*44) 

PROPOSAL CONTENT (§) NO 

# PROPOSAL COPIEp I + L/C!Jfh'CS 
No BID ):'ES NO· 

I.. Q 7".! .I:. I" JJ: 
DISQUALIFIED (REASON/S) 

. . 

YES 

YES 

YES 

YES 

YES 

;. YES 

II YES 

.. YES 

.. 

FAILORE: TO FILE A PROTEST WITHlN THE TIME l?RESCRIBED IN SECTION 120.57 (3} 1 

FLORIDA S!I!ATOTE$ (. .OR EU.LORE ':rO POS~ !!!HE 80ND . OR O':rHER SBC"UR:L'rY REQU'Jm;D ... 
BY LAW l'liTHIN T!!E .. TIME 1\LLOWED· FOR FILlliG A BOND Sl!AL!. CONSTI=E A WAIVER 
OF PROCEEDINGS UNDER CHAPTER .120, FLOEUDA STATOTES. ALL BIOS/PROPOSALS 
ACCEPTED BY THE STATE ARE: SUBJECT TO THE STATE t S TERMS AND CONDITIONS AND ANY 
AND ALI;. ADDITIONAL TERMS AND CoNDITIONS SUBMITTED B':( THE BIDDERS/P.ROPCSERS ARE 
REJECTED AND SHALL HAVE NO FORCE AND EFFECT. .OFFERS FROM THE VENDORS LISTED 
HEREIN ARE THE .0'$.LY OFFER'S RECEIVED TIMELY AS OF THE ABOVE Ol?ENING DATE AND 
TIME. ALL OTHER OFFERS SUBMITTED ,IN RESPONSE TO THIS SOLICI'TAT!ON, IF ANY, ARE 
EEREBY RE~CTED AS Lz:l.l'S. 

:2U:tREMEh'"T- ANY. EERSON WHO FILES AN 
~CISION PERTAINING TOA SOLICITATION 

SRALL AT THE TIME OF· FILING OF THE FORMAL PROTEST, POST WITH THE. UNIVERSITY A 
BOND PAYABLE TO THE ()NI</.El!Sin OF SOUTH .FLORIDA IN AN AMOUNT EQUAL TO: 10 . 
BERCENT OF THE ESTIMATED V~UE OF THE PROTESTORrs BID OR PROEOSAL: 10 PERCEN~ 
0~ THE ESTIMATED EXPENDITURE DORING' THE CONTRACT TE.~: $10 1 000: OR WHICHEVER 
IS LESS .• TBE BOND SHALL BE CQl:iDITIONEC UE'ON 'l'E.E PAYMENT OF ALL COSTS_ Wll:lCH. MAY 
BE 1UJJUDG.&D AGAINST THE CONTRACTOR :E'ILING THE PROTEST ACT.ION. IN LIEU OF' A 
BOND,_ THE UNIVERSITY MAY ACCii:PT A CASHIER 1 S C3ECK OR MONEY ORDER IN TEE AMOUNT 
OF THE. BOND- PAJ:LURE TO FILE TEE PROPER. BOND AT TEE Tl'ME OF F:O:.:cNG THE FO:P.M11L 

.,._ 'b.,._...,..,. .,..,...,. ... ,....,..,.,....,.,.,. ,.....,. m....., .,...,.,.,11'\t:Oorr'l PROTES!I:' SRALJ.j l'U:i;o.U.LO; .1..1.'( e. U.tt;-"'.U.U.. ~· ",!;= J::'.t<.VJ.;J:;~:J..:· • 

. 

NO YES NO YES .. NO ·.·YES NO 

NO YES NO YES NO YES NO 

NO YES NO YES NO YES NO 

NO YES NO YES NO ! YES NO .. 
NO YES NO YES NO YES NO 

. 
. 

No YES NO YES NO YES NO 

NO YES NO YES NO :YES NO 

NO YES }10 YES NO YES NO 

)PENED BY: Mark Lillquist TABULATED BY.: L&,z.ara Sl--i{)Fe/-e VERIFIEQ BY: __ _::==~--

~MARKS: CIRCLED PRICE INDICATES INTENT TQ AWARD. 
REV.S/7/2008 

·~-------.---- ., . .__,_., ........... . 



Ricoh Aficio MP C6501 SP/C7501 SP 
Color Digital Imaging System 
Exceptional Speed, Outstanding Quality 





Proven Productivity 
Staying competitive means doing more work in 
less time with accuracy and reliability. Trust the 
Ricoh Aficio MP C6501SP/C7501SP to provide 
exactly what demanding users need. 
• Reduce turnaround time with fast output. The MP C6501 SP delivers 60 

color and 65 black & white pages per minute and the MP C7501SP 
achieves speeds up to 70 color and 75 black & white pages per minute. 
Both offer duplexing at 100% of rated speed. 

• Accelerate productivity with one-pass duplex scanning. This not only 
reduces scan time, it minimizes wear and tear on sensitive originals. 

• Navigate to the features you need in just a few quick selections. 
The large full-color WVGA control panel is the same intuitive LCD 
touch-screen available on all Ricoh MFPs, so you can upgrade the 
fleet without retraining users. 

• Meet tight deadlines and complete quick-turn jobs with one of the 
shortest warm-up times and fastest first copy times of any high-speed 
color device in its class. 

• Optimize efficiency with the ability to reload paper without interrupting 
the current job. Total paper capacity with all options is an incredible 
7,400 sheets. 

High-End Finishing 
Extend the possibilities of document production 
with a variety of paper handling accessories and 
professional-grade finishing options. 
• Experiment with new formats. The Multi-fold Unit offers six folding 

options, including Half-fold, Double Parallel fold and Gate-Fold. 
• Create fulkolor output on a wide range of paper grades. The system 

accepts up to 140 lb. Index (253 gim') through the Paper Trays and up 
to 110 lb. Cover (300 g/m') through the Bypass Tray. 

• Improve uptime with the optional Large Capacity Tray. This 2,000-
sheet accessory holds paper sizes up to 12" x 18" and weights up 
to 110 lb. Cover (300 g/m'). 

• Distribute high-quality finished documents with stapling, hole punching, 
ring binding or saddle-stitching, depending on your needs. 

Reduce Operating Costs 
In addition to its best-in-class affordability, 
the Ricoh Aficio MP C6501SP/C7501SP delivers 
the speed and versatility organizations need 
to keep operating expenses low. 
• Perform a wide variety of color and finishing tasks in*house, eliminating 

the need to outsource complex jobs to expensive third*party providers. 
• Consolidate jobs from multiple laser or inkjet printers to cut supply costs. 
• Print marketing collateral, forms, training packets and other documents 

on demand instead of managing large volumes of preprinted inventory. 
• Empower creative teams to produce high*quality layouts, proofs and 

mock-ups with exceptional speed and quality. 
• Improve workflow in copy shops and print~ for~ pay environments by 

adding high-quality color capacity and finishing capabilities that are 
ideal for quick-turn jobs. 

Scan both sides of any original without feeding 
it twice using single*pass duplex scanning. 

Create a variety of full-color documents with 
different folding options. 

Choose the Ring Bind Unit to create ready
to-distribute training packets, reports and 
other lengthy documents. 



Enhance Performance and 
Quality While Reducing Cost 

Optional Cover Interposers 
Feed pre-printed sheets from one or 
two sources for front and back covers. 

Optional 3,000-Sheet Finishers 
Choose from 50- or 100-sheet stapling 
and 2- or 3-ho!e punching. 

Optional 2,000-Sheet Booklet Finisher 
Fold and staple full-color documents to produce 
finished booklets and 2- or 3-hole punching. 

50-Sheet Finisher 
This finisher lets you select multi-position 
stapling for documents up to 50 pages. 

Optional FDSOOO Multi-Fold Unit 
Execute several different folds to create 
a variety of finished documents. 

Optional RB5000 Ring Bind Unit 
Punch holes and insert plastic rings to 
produce ready-to-distribute books. 

BK5010e Booklet Maker 
Saddle stitch up to 30 sheets to create 
120-page booklets. 

GBC StreamPunchTM Ill 
Create professional-quality bound books with 
in-line punching in a variety of patterns. 

I 

I 

Versatile Paper Sources 
Standard paper sources include the Tandem 2 x 1, 100-Sheet Paper Tray, 
tvvo 550-Sheet Paper Trays and Bypass Tray for a total of 3,400 sheets. 
With additional options also shown here, this system can hold up to 7,400 sheets. 



impressive Image Quality 
The high-powered color print engine in the Ricoh 
Aficio MP C6501 SP/C7501 SP creates high-resolution 
images that capture your customers' attention. 
• Maximize edge definition, coverage consistency and color density with 

breakthrough PxP oil-free toner from Rico h. Smaller particles and a lower 
melting point combine to create smooth blends and solid fills. 

• Help visually impaired users with a special printer driver function that adjusts 
color levels to enhance readability. 

Optimize Color Output 
Configure the Ricoh Aficio MP C6501SP/C7501SP with 
the Fiery E-7200 print controller for professional
grade print and color control. 
• Boost on board power and expedite complex processing tasks with a 

2.0GHz processor. 
• Get all the advantages of Fiery color manipulation without giving up 

familiar Ricoh functionality for other tasks. Even if you choose the optional 
Fiery controller, you can keep user-friendly Ricoh menus for a full host 
of scanning capabilities. 

• Streamline workflow with convenient drag-and-drop functionality. 
Just point and click to move files from the desktop to a print 
queue, prepare files for output or balance workflow among multiple 
connected devices. 

• Maximize job-to-job efficiency with the Command WorkStation 
utility. Switch effortlessly from managing jobs to configuring the 
controller's settings. 

• Bridge the gap between platforms. The Fiery controller provides 
identical functionality in both Windows and Mac environments. 

Enhance Personal Productivity 
The App2Me® solution revolutionizes document 
management, enabling users to create customized 
workflows and execute them anywhere they go. 
• Download widgets to any client (desktop PC, laptop or Smartphone) and 

use them on any Ricoh MFP enabled with App2Me. 
• Enjoy maximum convenience and a consistent experience at each App2Me

enabled MFP, which is completely personalized no matter where you go. 
• Simplify complex workflows. Widgets can be created to combine, 

distribute, edit and create documents, as well as perform many other 
tasks automatically. 

• Maximize productivity. App2Me improves efficiency through widgets 
that control a virtually endless array of MFP, software or Web service
driven workflows. 

• Create specialized widgets for almost any need, in any framework 
across multiple platforms that App2Me supports, such as Google Desktop'" 
and more. 

Expect vivid, intense colors with a powerful 1200 
dpi print engine and new PxP oil-free toner. 

Expedite full-color job processing with the 
incredibly fast, EFI Fiery E-7200 print controller. 

With App2Me, you can download time-saving 
and workflow-enhancing widgets and use 
them at any Ricoh MFP enabled with the 
App2Me solution. 



Multifunction Performance 
The Ricoh Aficio MP C6501SP/C7501SP 
integrates a diverse range of capabilities 
into a relatively small footprint, enabling 
you to reach new heights of productivity 
and efficiency. 
• Manage virtually any document-related task with this 

incredibly versatile, high-speed system. Choose from 
advanced printing, copying, faxing and scanning functions. 

• Reduce network traffic with high-compression PDFs, 
especially when handling large full-color files. 

Protect Every 
Document 
Advanced security features 
ensure that sensitive documents 
and the system itself remain 
safe from multiple threats. 
• Restrict system access to authorized users. 

The system supports external (Windows, LDAP) 
and internal (basic and user code) authentication. 

• Protect business critical information with the 
DataOveJWriteSecurity System (DOSS) option. 
It automatically overwrites the hard drive after 
copy, scan, fax and print jobs. You can also use 
the HDD Encryption option to protect data, even 
if the hard drive is removed or stolen. 

Environmental Advantages 
Many organizations are "going green" by 
setting goals for sustain ability. The Ricoh 
Aficio MP C6501SP/C7501SP helps support 
these efforts. 
• Minimize total energy consumption. The Rkoh Aficio 

MP C6501 SP/C7501 SP uses significantly less electricity 
without compromising speed, productivity or functionality. 
It is also designed to use less energy during sleep mode. 

• Maintain outstanding image quality. With its lower melting 
point, PxP toner requires less energy, yet delivers the high
quality results you expect. 

The Total 
Green Office 
Solution 
Ricoh continues its long-standing 
commitment to developing office 
solutions with environmentally 
friendly and superior energy- and 
supply-saving features, without 
compromising productivity. 



General Spedficntions 
Configuration 
Scanning Element 

System Memory 
Document Feeder 

Copy Resolution 
Color/Grayscale 
Quantity Indicator 
Original Type 
Original Size 
Warm·Up Time 

First Copy Speed 

Output Speed 

Standard P<1per Capacity 

P<~per Size 
Paper Weight 

M<~gnification 

Zoom 
Power Requirements 

Dimensions (WxDxH) 
Weight 
Copier Features: 

Con50!e 
Aatbed ~·lith ffiO'.~ng 3-line CCD 
array image-scanning 
320GB {160GB X 2) (Shared) 
Standard \So-Sheet ADF with 
single-pass color duplex scanning 
600dpl 
256 Levels 
1. 9,999 
Shee!A!ooklobject 
Uptol1"x1r 
MP C6501SP; <70 5ec. 

MP (750\SP: <60 5ec, 

MP C6501SP: s.m.s sec (BWifC) 
MP C750\SP: 4.9/6.4 sec (BWIFC) 
MP C6501SP: 60165 (FCIBW) 
MP C7501SP; 7on5 (FCIBW) 
htTray 1,100 x 2 
550 sheets x 2nd & 3rd trays, 
\00-Sheet Bypass Tray 
3,400 standard 
7,400 sheet std. flkiX capadty 
5.5" X 8,5" tO 12° X \8" 
14 lb. Bond· 80 lb. Cover {216 g/rri') 
{fr.rJ 1, 2} 
\4/b. Bond· 140 lb. Jndex(253 gtml) 
(fra"J 3) 
17 lb. Bond· 90 lb. Index (163 glrr1) 
{Dup!ex) 
14 lb. Bond · 110 lb. Cover {300 gt'm') 
(Bypas.s) 
7 reductioo and 5 enlargement 
25% to400% in 1% inaements 
MP C6501SP: 120-127VI20JV60Hz 
MP C750\ SP: 208-240VI20JV60Hz 
29.5" X 33.5" X 48.4" [ind<Jding ADF) 
<6571bs. 

Auto Paper Selectioo, Auto Reduce/Enlarge, Auto Start, Auto Troj 
Switching, Auto lflklge Density, Duplex. User Codes, Stapling, 
Cdor Erase/Convert, Electronic Sort, Image Rotation, Rotate 
Sorting, Series Copo;, Doc Server, User Tools, Job Presets, Bookl 
SerieYCombine, InsErt Co:er/SiipSheet, Ch;aptering, Tabs, ColOf/ 
Image Cre<1tion, Samp~e Copy, Energy Saver, lm<1ge Adjustment, 
Multiple Security Options 

Printer Specifications (standard) 
CPU 
RAM 
HOD 
Standard Interfaces 
Optional Interfaces 

Net\vork: Protocol 
Operating Systems 

Print Drivers 

M<~x Print Resolution 

lnt~ Pentium · M 1.4GHz 
2GB (STDJMAX) 
320GB (160GB x 2) (Shared) 
Ethernet (10/\ OOOaselX), USB2.0 
Parallel, W!relessl..<\N 
0EEE802.11alg) Bluetooth, 
Ethernet 1000 Base-T 
TCPJIP. IPX/SPX, App~e Ta!k 
Window-:.: 2000/XPNtsta/Se!\'er 
2003, Serve-r 2008. Net-.•.we; 3.12, 
3.2, 4.1, 4.11, S.O, S.l, 6, 6.5. Unix, 
Sun So!aris, HP-UX. SCO OpeoS€1Wr, 
Redtlat Unux, IBM MX. MAC: OS 8.6 
- 9.2x, OSX 10.1 or later 
f'Cl5c, f'Cl6, XPS (standard), 
Adobe PS3 (optional) 
Up to 1200 dpi 

Scanner Specifications 
Scanning Resolution Up to 600 dpl 
Sum Area Up to II" x 1r 
Scan Speed Simplex BNJ 82 ipmiDup!ex BN-1 125 

ipm; Simplex Co!or 70 ipm/DtJplex 
Color 115ipm 

Compression BW/Binary ·TIFF MH.IM!VMMR 
fu'l Co!or/Grap:ale: JPEG 

Standard lnterf<~Ces \0/100Base1X, Wireless LAN 

Rl H 
www.ricoh-usa.com 
Bringing flkoh Value lo Your Organll~tion 

Scanner Features; 
BWIK f'tmto, B\'JIFC Te..ct, Auto Co!Of, Auto Density, Image Rotation, 
Mi~ed Size, SADF, Batch. Scan-to Modes Supported: Scan-to-fm.;:l, 
Scan-to-Fo!dl.'f, Sc<m-to-URl, TWAIN Scann'ng, US8/SD2.0 Scan-to 

Document Server Specifications (Standard) 
Max. Stored Documents 3,000 
Max. Pages per Dowment 3,000 
Max. Stored Pages 15,000 

Fax Specifications (Optional) 
Circuit PSTN, PBX 
Compatibjfjty ITU-T (ccrm G3, Addftional G3 opt 
Resolution 200 x 1001200 dpi (400 dpi w/opt. 

Compression Method 
Scanning Speed 
Modem Speed 
Transmission Speed 
Memory Backup 
QuiOO'Speed Dials 
Group Dials 
Energy Saver 

Accessories 
RT4000 DLTILCT 
Paper Capacity 
Paper Size 
Paper Weight 
Size 
Weight 

RT431LCT 
Paper Capacity 
Paper Size 
PaperWeight 
Size 
Weight 

CS391 9-B!n Mailbox 
Number of Bins 
Stack: Capacity of Bins 
Paper Size 
Paper Weight 
Size 
Weight 

2 sourc.:! Cover Interposer 

SAF memory) 
MH, MR. MMR, JB!G 
0.7 ~c. 
33.6 K · 2,400 bps 
G3: Approx 2 sec. 
1 hour 
2,000 numbers 
I 00 groups {500 per group) 
Standard 

2,000 sheets 
up to 12" x 18" 
14 lb. - 1 10 lb. Cam (300 glrr1) 
38.1"x28"x29.3" 
192 lbs. 

4,000 sheets 
8.5"x11" 
14 lb. · 34 lb. Bond (128 g/m1) 

12"x18"x26" 
441bs. 

9 
100 sheets 
5.5" X 8.5" ·\\"X 17" 
141b.- 341b. Bond {128 g.fml) 
2\"x24"x26" 
33lbs. 

Paper Size 5.5~ x 8.5" · 1Y X \8" 
PaperWeight 17 lb. Bond .. 110 lb.lnde:o: {199 g/m1) 

Size 28~ X 29~ X 50" 
Weight 99 Jbs. 
SRSOOO 100-Sheet Staple finisheru 
Capacity (Proof Tray} 500 sheets (8.5~ x II" or sma'!er) 

Paper Size 
Capacity (Shift Tray) 

Pa~rWeight 
Staple 

Size 
Weight 

250 sheets (8.5" x 14~ or larger) 
5.s· x a.s~- 12" x 1a~ 
8.5" x 11 ~ · 3,000 sht-ets 
85" X 14" ·II" X 17" • 1,500 sheets 
12" x 18" · \,000 sheets 
141b. Bond. 110 !b. (O.'ef {300 gtrr.2) 
8.5" X 11" · 100 pag~ 
8Y x 14" -II" X lr ·50 pages 
31"x29"x39" 
\651bs. 

,.SPSOOO m~st indude F.n:shff Adlpterl}pe C. 

SR4030 50-Sheet Staple finisher 
Capacity (Proof Tray) 250 sheets (8.5" X II" or Sflkl'ler) 

Paper Size 
Capacity {Shift Tray) 

Pa~rWeight 
Staple 

Size 
Weight 

SR4040 Booklet Maker 
Capacity (Proof Tray) 

Paper Size 
Capacity {Shift Tray) 

Paper Weight 
Staple 

50sheets{8.5" x 14" or larger) 
5.5" X 8.5" · 1Y X 18" 
8.5'' x II"· 3,000 sheets 
8.5" x 14" .. 11" x tr- l,soo she.?ts 
\4 Jb. Bond· 110 !b. (D",'ef {300 g/m') 
8.5" X\\"· 50 pages 
8.5" x 14" · 11" x 17" ·30 pages 
26"x24"x38" 
1191bs. 

250 sheets (8.5" X 11" or smaller) 
50 sheets (8.5" X \4" Of larger) 
s.s· xBS' -\2" x 18" 
8.5" X \1" • 2,000 sheets 
8.5" x 14" • 11" x 17" - 1,000 sheets 
14 lb. Bond· 110 lb. CD"oer {300 g!m') 
8.5" x 11"- so pages 
8.5" x 14" · 11" x 1r- 30 pages 

Saddle Stitch StapleH* 
Size 
Weight 

FOSOOO Mufti-Folding Unit 

8.5" x II" ·1Y X 18" -15 pages 
26"x24"x38" 
t39lbs. 

Compatible with SR5000 and SR4040 only. 
Folding Type: 
Single Sheet Mode: 2-Fold, Half-Fold/Print inside, Half-Fo!d!Print 
outside, letter Fold-inli'rint inside, letter Fo!d-in!Print outside, 
letter Fold-out, Double Para!fe!!Print inside, Double Paral!e!!Print 
outside, Gate·Fddfl>rint inside, Gate-Fold/Print outside. 
Muhiple Sheets Mode: same as s;ngle Sheet mode; up to 3 sheel5. 
Paper Size: 
Single Sheet fv'.ode: Z fold:ng; 8S x 11" · 12" x 18"; Half fold:ng: 
BY x II"; letterfo!Ong: 8Y x 1 I"- 12" x 18•; Doub!e Para!leV 
Gate fo!d:ng: 8Y X 11" · 12" x 18rr; Multi~e Sheets Mode; Half 
fo!d:ng: 8.5" x 11" ·12" x \8"; letterfo!ding: 8.5" x 11"; Doub[e 
ParaHei!Gate folding: 8.5D x 11" .. 12 • x 18~ 

6BC StreamPunch Ill 
Paper Size 
Paper Weight 
Ole Sets 

8.5"x11"lEf 
20 lb. Bond- 110 lb. Index {216 glm') 
CombBind&, Twin loop Wire (2:\ or 
3:1), Co!otCd.l". VeloBind&, Three· 
Ring, ProCiick" 

BK5010e Production Booklet Maker 
Paper Size 85"x 11" -11" x 17" 
Paper we-Ight 161b. Bond- II 0 lb. Index (216 glm') 

Ring Binder RBSOOO 
Paper Sizes Supported 8S x 11" (lff only) 
Max. Binding Capacity 100 sheets/booklet 
Ring Sizes Supported 50-sheet/100·sheet 
Paper Weight Punched 17 lb. Bond- 80 ro Cowr {2\6 glm'J 
PaperWeight Bound 171b. Bond .. 80 lb Co\'er(216 glm>) 
Dimensions (WxDxH) 34.25" x 28.7" x 38Y 
Power Requirements 11011\SV, 50/60Hz 
Weight 319.6 !bs. 

Additional Accessories 
Single Source Cover Interposer Type 3260; Punch Unit for SR5000; 
Punch Unit fot SR4030/4040; Jogger Option for 4030/4040; legal 
Tray for RT43 LCT Type 1075; 11" x 17" Tray Type 2105; Cop'J 
Connector Kit T)1Je 3260; Tab Sheet Unit Type 3260; File Format 
Converter Type E; HOD o .. erwrite Security Kit Type H; HDD 
Encryption Unit Type k. Copy Data Security Kit Type F; Mobe 
PostSaip\3 Type C7501; IEEE802.1lafgl)pe J; !Em284 Type k, 
Bluetooth interface Unit Type 3245; Bro.vser Unit Type E; G3 
Interface Kit Type C7500, Ke-1 Counter Bracket l)'pe 1027; Reader 
Key Card Bracket Type B; Key Card !IF Unit Type A; Gigabit Ethernet 
T)pe B; Cop-J TroJ Type 2075; FAX Memory Unit Type 832MB, 
US82.01SD S!ot TypeD 

Fiery E-7200 Specifications 
Controller Type Embedded Type 
Fiery Platform Fiery E20 
Maximum Continuous MP (650\SP: 6S ppm BIN, 60ppm cdor 

Print Speed MP 050\SP: 75 ppm BNJ, 70 ppm colof 
CPU lntel Core Duo T2500 2.0GHz 
Host Interface I000/100/108ASE·T 
Memory 1GB 
Internal HOD 80GB 
Operating System Unux 
Network Protocol TCPAP Ol'v411f\'6), App!eTa'k (Auto 

s.vitchingl, SMB 
Printer De.saiption language Adobe PostScript 3, f'Cl615c 
Max Ptint Resolution Up to 1200 dpi 
Max Scan Resolution Up to 600 dpi 
Fonts PS3: 138 fontsiPCl: 80 AGFA fonts 
Operation Panel On MfP 
Utilities Standatd: CommamM'orl<Station 5, 

Color Yl'lse Pro Too[s., Fle.y SCan, 
Printer Delete Utility, fieryVI'eb Tools 
Optional: SeeQuence Impose, Co!or 
Prof1ler Suite (UV version), Auto 
Trapp1ng, Spot-on, Hot Foklers 

Color Management Tools ICC Profile, Color Chart, CMYK 
Color Reference Pages, RGB Color 
Tests, Trapping Support, Co!orWise 

Calibration 
Pro Tools 
Color Cal, Densitometer, 
Spectrophotometer 
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